

Invoice Date: 02/06/15

Fed ID #31-1425096

File No. 05-016.96

Due Date: 03/08/2015

Invoice No. 162784

Period Ending: 1/31/15

Bergen Community College  
 Maria Ferrara  
 President's Office  
 400 Paramus Road  
 Paramus, NJ 07652

**File** Insurance Coverage - Ocampo  
**Description:**

**PROFESSIONAL FEES**

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
01/05/15	Alice M. Bergen	Review and analysis of expert report [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	1.00	150.00
01/05/15	Alice M. Bergen	Review and analysis of case management order [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.40	60.00
01/05/15	Victoria A. Flynn	Review correspondence/expert report of Diamond State; related follow-up	0.80	120.00
01/13/15	Alice M. Bergen	Correspond with S. Raso re deposition [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.40	60.00
01/13/15	Alice M. Bergen	Analysis of expert report [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.80	120.00
01/13/15	Victoria A. Flynn	Review of expert report [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	2.20	330.00
01/13/15	Alice M. Bergen	Review and analysis of Appellate Division opinion in preparation of meeting [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	1.50	225.00
01/13/15	Alice M. Bergen	Review and analysis of S. Raso's certification [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	1.00	150.00
01/15/15	Alice M. Bergen	Review and analysis of order and opinion re fee award [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.60	90.00
01/15/15	Alice M. Bergen	Analysis of fees to date [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.30	45.00

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
01/15/15	Alice M. Bergen	Analysis of [REDACTED] and issues related to same.	0.50	75.00
01/15/15	Alice M. Bergen	Preparation for meeting [REDACTED]	1.00	150.00
01/15/15	Alice M. Bergen	Continue review and analysis of order and opinion re fee award [REDACTED]	0.70	105.00
01/15/15	Victoria A. Flynn	Follow up on legal issues for information required for remand proceedings and discovery	0.70	105.00
01/16/15	Alice M. Bergen	Review and analysis [REDACTED]	1.50	225.00
01/16/15	Alice M. Bergen	Correspond with [REDACTED]	0.40	60.00
01/19/15	Alice M. Bergen	Correspond with [REDACTED]	0.40	60.00
01/19/15	Alice M. Bergen	Review and analysis of [REDACTED] law with regard to [REDACTED] and analysis of same.	1.30	195.00
01/21/15	Alice M. Bergen	Telephone conference with Lisa re deposition of S. Raso [REDACTED]	0.50	75.00
01/21/15	Alice M. Bergen	Correspond with A. Accardi re deposition of S. Raso.	0.40	60.00
01/21/15	Alice M. Bergen	Follow up telephone conference with Lisa at S. Raso's office re deposition of S. Raso.	0.40	60.00
01/21/15	Alice M. Bergen	Draft follow up correspondence to S. Raso re deposition.	0.40	60.00
01/26/15	Alice M. Bergen	Draft memo to J. Verrone re status of litigation [REDACTED] [REDACTED] re deposition of [REDACTED] with [REDACTED]	2.00	300.00
01/26/15	Alice M. Bergen	Analysis [REDACTED] review of order and opinion as well as [REDACTED] award to [REDACTED]	1.50	225.00
01/26/15	Alice M. Bergen	Revise and finalize memo to J. Verrone re status of litigation [REDACTED]	0.50	75.00

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
01/26/15	Victoria A. Flynn	Review strategies for hearing and [REDACTED]	1.00	150.00
<b>Total</b>			<b>22.20</b>	<b>\$ 3,330.00</b>

**FEE SUMMARY**

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Hrs At</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>/Hrs</u>	<u>Total</u>
Victoria A. Flynn	Partner	4.70		150.00		705.00
Alice M. Bergen	Associate	17.50		150.00		2,625.00
<b>Total Professional Fees</b>						<b>\$ 3,330.00</b>

**DISBURSEMENTS**

<u>Date</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Total</u>
	Reproduction	8.70

Total Disb. 8.70

Fees	\$ 3,330.00
Disbursements	\$ 8.70

<b>CURRENT INVOICE DUE</b>	<b>\$ 3,338.70</b>
Previous Balance Due	\$ 876.60
<b>TOTAL AMOUNT DUE</b>	<b>\$ 4,215.30</b>