

DECOTIIS

DeCotIis, FitzPatrick & Cole, LLP

OFFICE

GLENPOINTE CENTRE WEST
500 FRANK W. BURR BLVD. SUITE 31
TEANECK, NEW JERSEY 07666
T: 201.928.1100 F: 201.928.0588
WWW.DECOTIISLAW.COM

Invoice Date: 01/09/13

Fed ID #31-1425096
Due Date: 02/08/2013

File No. 05-016.63
Invoice No. 147020
Period Ending: 12/31/12

Bergen Community College
Wendy Dodge
President's Office
400 Paramus Road
Paramus, NJ 07652

File Unfair Labor Practice/In re: Keith Mitchell
Description:

PROFESSIONAL FEES

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
11/27/12	Avis Bishop Thompson	Teleconference with P. Bonomolo re: summary judgment decision	0.40	60.00
11/30/12	Avis Bishop Thompson	Correspondence from/to J. Schepisi re: notice of claim; review file re: UPC	0.40	60.00
12/04/12	Avis Bishop Thompson	Review file re: arbitration exhibits; correspondence from/to J. Schepisi re: arbitration; review and prepare file for transmittal	2.00	300.00
12/06/12	Avis Bishop Thompson	Review and finalize file transfer; draft letter to J. Schepisi re: file transfer; call to J. Schepisi re: office re: transfer	1.90	285.00
Total			4.70 \$	705.00

FEE SUMMARY

Timekeeper	Title	Hours	Hrs At	Rate	/Hrs	Total
Avis Bishop Thompson	Partner	4.70		150.00		705.00
Total Professional Fees					\$	705.00

DISBURSEMENTS

<u>Date</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Total</u>
	Reproduction	676.80
Total Disb.		676.80
Fees		\$ 705.00
Disbursements		\$ 676.80
CURRENT INVOICE DUE		<u>\$ 1,381.80</u>
Previous Balance Due		\$ 315.00
TOTAL AMOUNT DUE		<u>\$ 1,696.80</u>

Invoice Date: 01/14/13

Fed ID #31-1425096
Due Date: 02/13/2013File No. 05-016.96
Invoice No. 147287
Period Ending: 12/31/12Bergen Community College
Wendy Dodge
President's Office
400 Paramus Road
Paramus, NJ 07652**File Insurance Coverage - Ocampo**
Description:**NOTE: THIS INVOICE REPLACES OUR INVOICE #147021 1/9/13****PROFESSIONAL FEES**

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
11/27/12	Alice M. Penna	Review, revise and cite check brief on westlaw.	2.50	375.00
11/27/12	Alice M. Penna	Revise [REDACTED]; incorporate [REDACTED] into brief.	1.50	225.00
11/27/12	Alice M. Penna	Revise and finalize cover letter to court, notice of motion, cert. of service.	1.00	150.00
11/27/12	Alice M. Penna	Draft and finalize certification of counsel.	1.00	150.00
11/27/12	Alice M. Penna	Finalize brief in support of motion for an entry of an award of attorneys fees and exhibits for filing with court and on counsel.	2.00	300.00
11/27/12	Victoria A. Flynn	Edit and revise trial brief; related legal research	4.50	675.00
11/27/12	Victoria A. Flynn	Review affidavit of service; [REDACTED]	1.50	225.00
11/28/12	Alice M. Penna	Finalize corr. to A. Accardi.	0.40	60.00
11/28/12	Alice M. Penna	Review and draft response to counsel for Diamond State's correspondence.	0.40	60.00
11/28/12	Alice M. Penna	Review revisions to e-mail; draft supplemental certification and corr. to court filing same.	0.80	120.00
11/28/12	Victoria A. Flynn	Follow up re: trial preparation; review of correspondence from plaintiffs' counsel	2.20	330.00
11/29/12	Alice M. Penna	Confer with V. Flynn re trial prep.	0.30	45.00

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
11/29/12	Alice M. Penna	Review and revise exhibit list in prep. of trial.	1.00	150.00
11/29/12	Alice M. Penna	Research [REDACTED]	1.00	150.00
11/29/12	Victoria A. Flynn	Review correspondence; respond accordingly; review exhibits; follow up about upcoming hearing	3.00	450.00
11/30/12	Victoria A. Flynn	Prepare for court hearing scheduled for Monday; update college	7.50	1,125.00
11/30/12	Alice M. Penna	Review brief in prep. for hearing.	1.00	150.00
11/30/12	Alice M. Penna	Draft certification of [REDACTED] review corr. re same.	2.00	300.00
11/30/12	Alice M. Penna	Prepare for trial.; review and revise draft [REDACTED]	2.00	300.00
11/30/12	Alice M. Penna	Continue to review affidavit of service, brief in prep. of trial.	2.00	300.00
11/30/12	Alice M. Penna	Telephone conference with A. Accardi re consent order 2x; draft corr. re same.	0.50	75.00
12/02/12	Victoria A. Flynn	Prepare for trial	5.00	750.00
12/03/12	Alice M. Penna	Conference with V. Flynn to prepare for trial; draft [REDACTED], prep for testimony; review and analyze case law and brief in support of entry of award.	4.00	600.00
12/03/12	Alice M. Penna	Appear before Judge Polifroni, attend pre-trial conference.	3.50	525.00
12/03/12	Alice M. Penna	Telephone conference with B. Hylas in Judge De la Cruz's chambers; draft corr. re same; review corr. [REDACTED]	0.50	75.00
12/03/12	Victoria A. Flynn	Attend trial call; conference with court; related follow up with proposed witnesses as to status of hearing; follow up regarding next steps; prepare status report for client	6.80	1,020.00
12/04/12	Victoria A. Flynn	Follow up regarding status of briefing/plenary hearing	0.30	45.00
12/04/12	Alice M. Penna	Research [REDACTED] in preparation of conference call with Judge De la Cruz.	0.70	105.00
12/05/12	Alice M. Penna	Review instructions from Judge De la Cruz's chambers.	0.40	60.00
12/06/12	Judy A. Verrone	Review/revise letter [REDACTED]	0.20	30.00
12/06/12	Alice M. Penna	Correspondence with A. Accardi re court conference.	0.40	60.00
12/07/12	Alice M. Penna	Prep. for conference call with Judge D La Cruz/ review issues.	1.00	150.00

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
12/07/12	Alice M. Penna	Preparation for conference call with Court re trial/ Review motion pursuant to R. 4:42-9.	1.00	150.00
12/07/12	Alice M. Penna	Conference call with Court re trial.	0.50	75.00
12/07/12	Alice M. Penna	Draft follow up correspondence re conference call with Court.	0.70	105.00
12/07/12	Victoria A. Flynn	Follow up re: court conference	0.20	30.00
12/10/12	Alice M. Penna	Conference with V. Flynn re Conference call with court.	0.30	45.00
12/20/12	Alice M. Penna	Review Diamond States trial brief [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	1.00	150.00
12/24/12	Alice M. Penna	Preliminary draft of response to Diamond State's trial brief.	1.00	150.00
12/24/12	Victoria A. Flynn	Review opposition to attorney fees from counsel for Diamond State;	0.20	30.00
12/26/12	Alice M. Penna	Review Diamond State's trial brief and exhibits.	1.00	150.00
12/27/12	Alice M. Penna	Draft reply to trial brief.	2.00	300.00
12/27/12	Alice M. Penna	Review case law [REDACTED]	0.70	105.00
12/27/12	Alice M. Penna	Review counsel for Diamond State's bills.	0.80	120.00
12/28/12	Alice M. Penna	Continue to review counsel for Diamond State's bills and draft follow up corr. re same.	0.80	120.00
12/28/12	Alice M. Penna	Revise Ocampo reply to trial brief, finalize for filing.	2.00	300.00
Total			73.10	\$ 10,965.00

FEE SUMMARY

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Hrs At</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>/Hrs</u>	<u>Total</u>
Judy A. Verrone	Partner	0.20		150.00		30.00
Victoria A. Flynn	Partner	31.20		150.00		4,680.00
Alice M. Penna	Associate	41.70		150.00		6,255.00
Total Professional Fees					\$	10,965.00

DISBURSEMENTS

<u>Date</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Total</u>
11/27/12	Travel - Vendor - Triana, Angela	3.06
11/27/12	UPS	21.93

11/28/12	Postage	1.50
11/28/12	UPS	15.18
11/28/12	UPS	15.18
11/28/12	UPS	15.18
11/30/12	Filing Fee - Vendor - Superior Court of New Jersey - filed motion.	30.00
11/30/12	Legal Research - Vendor - West (West Group)	393.47
12/03/12	Travel - Vendor - Penna, Alice M.	5.00
12/03/12	Travel - Vendor - Flynn, Victoria A.	7.00
12/31/12	Legal Research - Vendor - West (West Group)	22.17
	Reproduction	1,196.00

Total Disb. 1,725.67

Fees	\$ 10,965.00
LESS: Professional Courtesy Discount.	\$ (2,500.00)
Disbursements	\$ 1,725.67

CURRENT INVOICE DUE	<u>\$ 10,190.67</u>
Previous Balance Due	\$ 7,900.07
TOTAL AMOUNT DUE	<u>\$ 18,090.74</u>